RESOLUTION 2025-11-24-08

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Flail Cutter Parts to
the only responsive bidder, TriGreen Equipment as follows:

FLAIL CUTTER PARTS
PART NUMBER DESCRIPTION UNIT COST
3720 3720 BEARING NO BID
3780 3780 TIGER BEARING NO BID
21223 SPOCKET 58.66
21584 21584 TIGER BOLTS 2.13
21632 CAPSCREW 0.86
21700 21700 NUT 0.66
22592 FLAP 122.40
26297 26297 TIGER SEAL NO BID
27580 27580 TEGER BEARING 15.33
27938 27938 TIGER WASHER 0.70
28682 28682 SPACER 36.12
28683 28683 CUTTER BEARING 357.56
28723 28723 TIGER BUSHING 69.25
28735 28735 ROLLER ADJUSTMENT BRACKET 125.08
28737 75 STD ROT BAFFLE 291.62
28738 28738 75" ROLLER SHAFT 720.69
28745 28745 90"CUTTER SHAFT 4,275.61
28747 28747 74"CUTTER SHAFT 3,765.73
28914 COUPLER 112.05
28950 28950 TIGER GEAR BOX 1,612.80
29529 29592 TIGER BEARING NO BID
29590 29590 TIGER BEARING NO BID
30136 30136 TIGER SEAL 25.88
31204 STRING GUARD 162.30
31298 31298 TIGER BEARING 44.41
31731 BOLT 13.80
31771 31771 TIGER SPINDLE REBUILT KIT 532.30
32143 DRAFT BEAM 4,355.90
32215 HYD CYL 3" X 12" 628.63
32372 PIN 1.5X 4.94 47.81
32380 32380 BOOM PIN 37.56
32502 32502 TIGER SEAL NO BID
32696 BUSHING 163.56
32952 RUBBER FLAP 133.52




33204 GUARD MOUNT PLATE 1.00 X 13.38 PIN FOR SUBFRAME 123.51
33710 1.00 X 13.38 PIN FOR SUBFRAME 63.58
33774 BOOM MOER FLAP 50" 37.33
33775 TRASH DEFLECTOR 50" 197.88
33785 33785 BOOM FLP CYLINDER 298.25
33863 33863 STRING GUARD TIGER 199.56
33984 33984 CYLINDER PIN 31.82
34334 34334 SWING CYLINDER BEARING 55.92
34335 TIGER BEARING SPHERICAL 1.5" 250.28
34396 34396 FLOW RESTRICTOR 21.53
34497 34497 BLADE BOLT TIGER 20.74
34713 34713 HOSE 1" X 60" 228.76
40496 40496 TENSIONER ROD 14.57
100761 CLEVIS 6.40
301268 301268 BOOM PIN NO BID
323215 323215 CYLINDERS NO BID
650243 FLAP 90" FRONT TIGER 14.75 X 90.63 NO BID
701043 CLEVIS NO BID
06520414 PTO DRIVE SHAFT 566.56
06700261 CUTTERSHAFT 96" STD 4,042.02
02967328 BUSHING 123.66
06320114 SHIELD BELT WELDMENT 346.34
06320237 6320237 GRNDRLLR 8.90 935.23
06320296 TIGER MOTOR OUNT FOR MW-68 & MW66 464.00
06320325 GROUND ROLLER 1,156.22
06370109 PUMP COUPLER SPLINE 91.08
06370380 STUB SHAFT 134.31
06380110 PUMP GUARD NEW 401.35
06400018 SPACER, RAR FLAIL 31.60
06400717 STOP, ROSTA 37.72
06401034 6401034 MOUNTING BRACKET PUMP 143.50
06401053 MOTOR MOUNT NO BID
06401245 6401245 BRACKET 30.91
06410723 BAR, RUB 180.12
06413162 MNT, FLAP FRONTVERT 96" NO BID
06420094 6420094 TENSIONER SPACER 23.87
06420100 PIN 1.25X 3.69 55.46
06420101 CROSS OVER SHAFT 90" 400.19
06420109 SHAFT 380.94
06420149 SHAFT 269.33
06420220 ROLLER END CAP 72.40




06430072  |SPACER 44.57
06500430 |HYDRAULIC HOSE 184.40
06500470  |HYDRAULIC HOSE 385.29
06500645  |SUCTION HOSE 1.5X 24 453.21
06500806  |HYDRAULIC HOSE 246.92
06501029 |3 13.88 SWING CYLINDER TIGER 1,120.49
06501294  [HOSE 1.5" X 95" 388.06
06504132  |MOTOR GEARBOX 2,040.37
06505013  |VALVE SEATKIT 47.61
06505044  |6505044 FILTER ASSY 274.84
06505067  |6505067 SIGHT GLASS 62.28
06520027  |6520027 BRARING CAP 111.50
06520028  |6520028 ROLLER BEARING 586.53
06520029 16520029 O-RING KIT 1.87
06520218  |SHEAVE 197.35
06520238  |50" MOWER FLAP 83.75
06520243  [FLAP 90 FRONT 4.75" X 90.63 255.90
06520244  |FLAP 96" FRONT 272.46
06520267  |BELT 37.34
06520306  |6520306 TENSIONER ARM 418.97
06520308  |6520308 FLANGE BEARING 220.22
06520414  |PTO DRIVE SHAFT 566.56
06520551  |SHEAVE 171.71
06521001  |6521001 TIGER BOOM CUTTER BLADES 88.10
06530001 |6530001 BEARING CAP BOLTS 0.56
06530217  |6530217 BOLTS 5.08
06538000  |6538000 TIGER BLADE BOLTS 26.59
06700092  |ASSY, SHEAVE, IDLER 3GVR 354.10
06700210 |6700210 96" CUTIERSHAFT 3,599.20
06700267  [ROLLER SHAFT 75" X 6" 1,164.28
06700268  [ROLLER SHAFT 90" 6 1,302.35
06700269 (96" ROLLER SHAFT 1,290.97
06770002  |6770002 ROLLER BEARING 580.78
22045) BONNET 4,022.81
22847A BOSS LINKAGE PIN 32.42
26142A 26142A KEYWAY 12.52
27972A 90" GROUND ROLLER 6" X 90" 793.08
27975A TIGER FLAP 94.70
28086HD 28086HD TIGER SKID HD NO BID
28416B OUTPUT SHAFT 96" 294.04
286798 MOTOR CHANNEL 601.40
28703B MOTOR CHANNEL 267.56
3/SV670SK  |3/5V670AK PULLEY NO BID




301268 PIVOT HEAD PIN 78.67
30531A 3053IA UPPER BOOM 788.48
6T-0150 CYLINDER 3 X 18 657.98
6T-0151R CYLINDER 3X 10 541.99
6T0375B 6T0375B COUPLER 75.56
670649 670649 TEMP GAUGE 43.98
6T0650 6T0650 FILTER 46.80
6T-1023R 6T-1023R BLADE NUT 5.76
6T-1029 CHAIN COUPLING 72.65
6T-1031 SPROCKET 93.73
671033 COVER 84.31
6T-2330 6T-2330 SOCKET HEAD BOLT 1.85
6T-2331 6T-2331 SOCKET HEAD BOLT 1.79
703999HD 703999HD FLAIL CUTTER BLADES NO BID
BLV10679 BLV10679 HUB COUPLER 2,590.48
PT3611A PT3611A CLEVIS 35.83
RD1032 RD1032 FLIP PIN 5.87
TB1033 PIN 17.00
TB1035 SPACER PVT ASSY BUSH 1X 4.75 82.09
TB1036 PIN 1.00 X 4.69 WO .47 TAPER PIN 44.43
TB3010 TB3010 BUSHING 16.06
TB3031 TUBE CLAMP 50.86
TF-3620A TF-3620A TENSION ADJUST SPRING 31.30
TF1018 FLANGE BEARING 358.92
TF1021BPK [NUT AND BOLT NO BID
TF1032 8" GREASE HOSE 10.98
TF1040 GUARD, CUTTERSHAFT 64.45
TF1116 FLAP 90" REAR 8" X 90 5/8" 159.27
TF1124 KEYWAY 5.52
TF1605 FLAP, DEFLECTOR, TSF/TRF96 181.57
TF1606 FLAP RETAINING BAR 69.02
TF3040 TF3040TIGER PULLEY 212.12
TF3044 TF3044 TIGER DRIVE PULLEY 236.57
TF3620A TENSION ADJUSTMENT SPRING 31.30
TF-4333A GROUND ROLLER ADJ BRACKET 133.21
TF4334 ROLLER ADJ ROD 124.52
TF4335 ROLLER ADJ ROD 124.52
TF4336 CLAMPING BLOCK LH 12.90
TF4365 INNER SHOE 201.22
TF4371 OUTER SHOE 204.77
TF-4500A ARM 160.65
TF4507B RIGHT ARM LIFT LINKAGE 111.67
TF4519 PIN, LINKAGE 46.96




TF1102A 90" CUTTERSHAFT 4,431.28
6520028 TG-06570028 ROLLER BEARING 586.53
21584 TAP BOLT 5/16X2 2.13
21625 3/8" TIGER NUT 0.14
21677 TG21677 FLAIL BLADE NUT 0.63
23152 TG-23152 PUMP 1,316.95
24701 TG24701 TENSJONER NUT 0.84
28571 BRG FLANGE 1.25" BEARING 216.80
28683 TG-28683 CUTTERSHAFT BEARING 357.56
30013 TG-30013 BLADE BOLT 1.48
34011 TG34011 FLAIL BLADE BOLT 1.88
34244 ELBOW 1/2" X 1/2" 29.80
TF1002 75" CUTTERSHAFT NO BID
TF1045B TG-TF1045B ROLLER STUB SHAFFTIGER 121.77
TF3040 PULLEY 212.12
06412511 MNT FLAP FRONT 204.15
06520242 FLAP RUBBER 201.28
TF1016 FLAP, DEFLECTOR TSF 63" 137.84
06520241 FLAP, 63" FRONT 191.75
28700 BAR, FLAP TSF/TBF 63" 230.92
TF1029 BAR, FLAP, TSF, TBF 75" 64.36
33863 STRING GUARD 199.56
31204 STRING GUARD 162.30
06420101 90" MOWER CROSS OVER SHAFT 400.19
28914 COUPLER 112.05
06520308 FLANGE BEARING 220.22
28950 GEAR BOX 1,612.88
TF1120 PIN, 1.13" 47.98
06520522 BEARING 2.75" 96.38
06320261 SAFETY TUBE NO BID

Said eBid #2025-10-11611 is located within the office the county’s Chief Financial Officer.




